
 
OPEN LETTER TO ALL 

"PUBLIC SERVANTS" 
 

We the People, draw your attention to your employment with the misleading suggestion that you 
may believe you are a “public servant”. There cannot be such a role when in fact you are employed 
by a corporate entity with its own constitution and corporate objectives. 

Your position is not an appointment by public, but is a role within a corporate entity for which you 
may not be aware, has no legal obligation to serve the people. Therefore, the work that you do for 
the corporation under the title of a “Government” department or elected official, is fraudulent and 
misrepresents the Commonwealth of Australia. 

Most alarming is the allegiance your role demonstrates to unelected foreign globalist organisations 
such as; World Health Organisation (WHO), World Economic Forum (WEF) and the United 
Nations (UN). 

Please be aware that the ethical operation of the corporate entity you are employed by or contracted 
with, has therefore been compromised by significant breaches of the Corporations Act 2001 for 
failing to declare interests and dealings with foreign entities, and the failure of its Executive, 
“Ministerial” or Governance Team to act in a manner befitting of a public servant of the 
Commonwealth of Australia, or an elected or appointed representative of the people. 

This misuse of elected authority has cultivated a breach of trust, and the necessity for the people to 
declare “no confidence” in your public service employment organisation and the position you hold. 
Your immediate resignation is demanded, unless you recognise your community’s demand for 
higher moral standards, and take immediate action to stop facilitating foreign agenda of unelected 
private organisations, including but not limited to WEF, UN and WHO. 

You have an obligation to do what is right, as opposed to supporting what is wrong! If you are 
helping to facilitate tyranny upon Australians, you and others may be held personally liable, whilst 
the victims, the local residents and associated groups, may be within their rights to pursue legal 
remedy against you for your role within this corporate entity. 

Your involvement in carrying out any foreign agenda or policy orders against the public makes you 
nothing more than a “Policy Enforcer” for the corporate entity you are currently employed by. The 
Public are now waking up and declaring this arrangement to be fraudulent and misleading. 

Your employer carelessly exposed its position when it disrespected the inalienable rights of the 
people, continued to act dishonourably by imposing fake laws and regulations without 
constitutional support, and enforced compliance upon all who unknowingly placed their trust in a 
corrupt system. This has had the effect of alerting people to the systemic corruption within the 
system, and naturally they want to know who is to blame. 

You are advised the truth is now out in the open and the people find blame in you. There is now a 
groundswell of NO CONFIDENCE arising in all local areas. Your name is now implicated with the 
crimes being committed by the corporate entity you are employed by or contracted to, and falsely 
representing an Australian Commonwealth Government Official. 
 



To admit your position is untenable, is to recognise your wages are afforded by taxes paid by the 
people, but you demonstrate no moral accountability to the people, and you persist with your 
support for international crime syndicates, namely; WHO, UN, WEF, C40, ICLEI, and their 
coordinated campaign against the interests of sovereign nations worldwide. 

If you respect the rights of the people, you must take this matter seriously. You are being asked to 
either stand down, or recognise your community’s demand for higher moral standards, and take 
immediate action to stop facilitating foreign agenda of unelected private organisations. 

Moreover, the people are not happy being subjected to the unlawful use of potentially harmful 5G 
equipment, coerced to ignore their medical and privacy rights, suffering abuse and criminal 
behaviour from Government and the Police. It is this widespread authoritarian control and disregard 
for the freedoms, rights and privileges of the people, that is perpetuating a decline into communism.  
 
You, unknowingly or otherwise, along with other corrupt public servants are currently part of that 
process. 

Here are just a few of the problems being created by public servants without the consent of the 
people: 

Mass surveillance and facial recognition cameras and databases, being used in public areas, without 
public permission or consultation, is typically the same as population control measures that are 
being forced upon the people in communist China. Australia by measure, could now be considered 
a communist country. 
 
The reckless adoption of the 5G network by Governments and the localised facilitation of 
potentially harmful military grade frequencies by Councils, has never been tested for safety on 
humans and animals. We the people, call for a halt to the rollout of 5G until transparent and 
comprehensive safety investigations are completed. 
 
Coercion of workers, medical patients and children to participate in experimental gene therapy trials 
using injection of mRNA (Covid19) non vaccines, was facilitated by media manipulation and the 
suppression of mass injury and death rates. 

Police violently attacking innocent men, women and children in public locations who were wrongly 
accused of behaving illegally during unlawful lock-down mandates. 
 
Corporate local Councils generally creating barriers and actively avoiding accountability while 
operating a culture of corporate dictatorship and implementing SMART 15 minute cities, digital ID, 
population control, and passing bylaws that infringe upon the people's rights, without the consent of 
the people. 
 
Chemicals containing heavy metals constantly sprayed from planes above our towns to manipulate 
weather, where several cloud seeding events, were evidenced days prior to excessive rain events 
creating property damage, flooding, hardship and deaths of people and livestock. 
 
This OPEN LETTER TO PUBLIC SERVANTS, seeks either their resignation, or a conscious 
change in their behaviour and moral culture to that which is not fraudulent and misleading, 
genuinely serves the people, acts truthfully and honourably in the people's interests, upholds the 
Commonwealth of Australia Constitution Act 1901, removes corrupt and treasonous actors, makes 
good on past indiscretions and damaging decisions against the nation and its people. 


